
REDEEMER LUTHERAN SCHOOL 

STUDENT – PARENT ATHLETIC PARTICIPATION CONTRACT 

AND PARENT PERMISSION FORM 

  

Student: ____________________________________________ 

Sport(s) ____________________________________________ 

2021 – 2022 School Year 

Parent and Student-Athlete: Review this contract carefully (front and back), complete information as 
requested, affix signatures, and return the completed contract/permission form to the school. 

Stipulations 

The student-athlete and his or her parent/guardian have received and read the Redeemer Lutheran School 
Athletic Handbook. Based on this information, the student and parent/guardian understand and stipulate to the 
following:  

1. I/We understand the eligibility regulations required for participation and affirm that all eligibility 

requirements have been satisfied, including age (WPIAL), medical (2015) and academics. 

2. I/We affirm that the student will exert effort to maintain a high level of academic achievement. 

3. I/We understand there is potential for serious, catastrophic, or life-threatening injury associated with 
participation in a sport. 

4. I/We affirm that the student will not participate in poor sportsmanship, or inappropriate conduct of any nature 
– in/out of school, on/off the court or field, and instead demonstrate Christ-like behavior. 

5. I/We, as parents will encourage my/our child to be compassionate and caring to their teammates, coaches, 
and opponents. 

6. I/We, as a participant or spectator, will exhibit a high level of sportsmanship at contests. 

7. I/We will follow appropriate procedures in communicating concerns to coaches. 

8. I/We affirm that the student will abide by all team and participation standards. 

9. I/We affirm that the student will not use steroids, illegal drugs, alcohol, and tobacco unless 

medically prescribed for a specific condition or illness an on record in the school office. 

10. I/We understand that students will be transported by car to and from games. 



11. I/We will submit payment for uniforms (prior to the first game) and other costs (as needed – gas, refs). 

 Permission to Participate 

I/We hereby authorize and consent to our child’s participation in interscholastic athletics and sports at 
Redeemer Lutheran School. 

We understand that the sport in which our child will be participating is potentially dangerous, and that physical 
injuries may occur to our child requiring emergency medical care and treatment. I/We assume the risk of injury 
to our child that may occur in an athletic activity.  

In consideration of the acceptance of our child by Redeemer Lutheran School in its athletic program, and the 
benefits derived by our child from participation, I/we agree to release and hold harmless the Board of directors, 
its members, the Administrator, the principal, all coaches, and any and all other of their agents, servants, 
and/or employees and agree to indemnify each of them from any claims, costs, suits, actions, judgment, and 
expenses arising from our child’s participation in interscholastic athletics. 

I/We hereby give our consent and authorize Redeemer Lutheran School and its agents, servants, and/or 
employees to consent on our behalf and on behalf of our child, to emergency medical care and treatment in the 
event we are unable to be notified by reasonable attempts of the need for such emergency medical care and 
treatment. 

  

  

I, ____________________________________________ and I, _________________________ 

                                                       (parent’s name)                                                                                                            (student’s name) 

have carefully reviewed the Student- Parent Athletic Handbook and the Student/Parent Athletic Participation 
Contract and Parent Permission Form. I/We understand the conditions for participation in the Redeemer 
Lutheran School interscholastic athletic program, and we understand there are inherent risks associated with 
participation.  

I/We agree as follows: 

My son/daughter has my/our permission to participate in  ____________________________ 

                                                                                                                                                                              (name of sport) 

at Redeemer Lutheran School. 

I/We understand and conform to all of the statements in the Stipulations portion of the Contract. 

  
  



 

I/We have enclosed the fee designated for this sport.    

MS Soccer - $55 

HS Volleyball - $65, MS Volleyball - $55 

Cross Country -  $35 plus $15 for a uniform 

Middle/High Boys & Girls Basketball,  $60 

Bowling - $15 and  pay as you play – about $10/practice. 

Please affix signatures below. 

   

Parent: _________________________________________________        Date: ______________________ 

Signature of Parent or Legal Guardian        Date 

  

Parent: _________________________________________________        Date: ______________________ 

Signature of Parent or Legal Guardian        Date 

  

Student: _________________________________________________       Date: ______________________ 

Signature of Student          Date 

  

*In the event that both parents retain legal guardianship of the student, the signatures of both parents are required. 

  

Emergency Information:  In case of an injury requiring an EMT team, or Emergency physician and hospital care, what would they need 
to know to treat your child? 

Insurance Carrier: __________________________________  Ins. # ___________________________________ 

Information about student: 

 


